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Purpose of the policy 

 
Offshorecert acknowledges the significant impact our operations can have on the environment. 
We are committed to not only minimizing our environmental footprint but also to fostering a 
culture of sustainability and environmental stewardship. 
 

Commitment to Excellence and Compliance: 
 
We adhere to the highest environmental management standards, aligning our practices with the 
international standard BS EN ISO 14001-2015. Our dedication to continuous improvement in 
environmental performance is unwavering. We rigorously identify and comply with local and 
international environmental regulations, ensuring our operations meet or exceed legal and 
ethical standards. 
 

Proactive Environmental Management: 
 
We proactively manage our activities to mitigate any adverse effects on the environment. This 
includes a systematic approach to identifying, evaluating, and managing environmental risks 
associated with our operations. Our team is empowered and encouraged to contribute to 
environmental protection initiatives, emphasizing the importance of collective action for a 
sustainable future. 
 

Pollution Prevention and Waste Management: 
 
We are committed to identifying and mitigating pollution sources across all our operations. Our 
objectives and targets are designed to minimize environmental risks, focusing on waste 
reduction, recycling, and responsible waste disposal. We strive for a circular economy approach, 
where resources are reused and regenerated to minimize waste. 
 

Engagement and Collaboration: 
 
Recognizing the importance of collaboration, we extend our environmental policies and practices 
to our work on customer sites, adhering to and complementing their environmental standards. 
We engage with all stakeholders, including employees, customers, and the community, to foster 
an inclusive approach to environmental management. 
 

Transparent Communication: 
 
Our Environmental Management System is communicated transparently to all stakeholders, 
ensuring that our commitment to the environment is clear and actionable. We encourage 
feedback and dialogue to continuously refine our environmental practices. 
 

Sustainability Goals and Review: 
 
We set ambitious annual environmental improvement goals, informed by a thorough review of 
our operations' inputs and outputs. These goals are regularly assessed for effectiveness, ensuring 
continuous progress towards our long-term sustainability vision. 
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Innovation for Sustainability: 

 
We invest in innovative technologies and practices that enhance our environmental performance. 
By staying at the forefront of sustainable practices, we not only improve our operations but also 
contribute to the broader environmental agenda. 
 

Community and Ecosystem Support: 
 
Beyond our immediate operations, we are committed to supporting community initiatives and 
projects that contribute to environmental conservation and ecosystem restoration. We believe in 
the power of collective action to make a significant positive impact on the planet. 
 

Offshorecert's Promise: 
 

Our environmental policy is a living document reflecting our evolving commitment to the planet. 
We pledge to be accountable, transparent, and proactive in our environmental stewardship, 
setting a benchmark for excellence in environmental management. 
 
 

 

 

 


